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$EVWUDFW
Technological resources can ask for different methods of learning through [the use 
of] powerful visuals and well-organised print; through direct, vicarious, and 
virtual experiences; and through tasks requiring analysis, synthesis, and 
evaluation, with applications to real-life situations. They can encourage self-
reflection and self-evaluation. They can drive collaboration and group problem 
solving. Technologies can help students learn in ways they find most effective and 
broaden their repertoires for learning … . Fast, bright students can move quickly 
through materials they master easily and go on to more difficult tasks; slower 
students can take more time and get more feedback and direct help from teachers 
and fellow students.

This article complements the demonstration of a web site that I developed with a team of 
students and colleagues at City University of Hong Kong and with staff from Launchpad 
Multimedia. The web site, ‘You and Your Client: The Art of Legal Interviewing,’ is 
designed to teach law students how to conduct an initial client-centred interview. In this 
paper, I describe what has been accomplished and discuss the potential that modern 
technology holds to revolutionize the teaching of legal skills. 

.H\ZRUGV: Legal Education, CAL, Legal Interviewing, Teaching of Legal Skills, 
Using Technology to Enhance Learning

�� ,QWURGXFWLRQ���%DFNJURXQG�
Late in 2000, the Louis M Brown International Client Counselling Competition was 
introduced to Hong Kong. For those readers who are unfamiliar with the competition: the 
late Professor Louis M Brown conceived and developed the ideas behind the competition. 
The competition is specifically designed to help students develop their interviewing, 
counselling, planning, teamwork, and analytical skills. Its main aim is to promote 
knowledge of preventive law. Student teams are given a note to file that gives them basic 
information about the 30-minute interview that they will conduct of a client. The client is
played by a trained actor who has been given instructions about the role and the amount 
and timing of the release of delicate or confidential information. At the conclusion of the 
interview, the students are given 15 minutes within which to debrief their interview and 
plan the carriage of the matter. A panel of three judges comprised of two lawyers and one 
social worker judges the team and provides constructive feedback to the students. The 
best team wins the competition. Over the years the number of international competitors 
has grown considerably.  

In order to bring the benefits of the competition to Hong Kong, colleague Charu Sharma 
and I coached several teams of third-year law students and accompanied the winning team 
from City University of Hong Kong to the international competition in April 2001. In 
April 2002 colleague Anthony Upham and I escorted the second City University law 



student team to the international competition.

Despite the energy invested and the hours involved in coaching a team, our efforts were 
not counted in the allocation of teaching for the academic year. I was not surprised. Client 
interviewing and is not offered as a separate subject in universities in Hong Kong in 
either the undergraduate or post-graduate law programmes. Nor is client interviewing 
likely to be offered as a stand-alone subject in the very near future, given that legal 
education and training in Hong Kong is currently under review.  This position contrasts 
sharply with that of other common law jurisdictions where, for example in the USA 
universities compete vigorously with one another to send a team to the annual Louis M 
Brown International Client Counselling Competition and where, for example in many 
institutions in Australia the teaching of interviewing and counselling forms part of the 
mainstream law curriculum.

Since client interviewing is not included in the formal course of study for Hong Kong 
students and since teaching students to learn how to interview clients is labour and 
resource intensive, I realised that if participation in the international competition were to 
continue I needed to develop an efficient and effective educational approach that would 
limit face-to-face contact with students yet at the same time provide sufficient incentive 
for them to compete. Attendance at an overseas conference provided the carrot. The use 
of information technology provided the means. In order to exploit the advantages that 
flexible teaching/learning innovations offer to teach legal skills, I applied for and was 
awarded a Quality Enhancement Fund (QEF) grant by City University.

���:K\�&RPSXWHU�$VVLVWHG�/HDUQLQJ"��7KH�3URGXFWLRQ�RI�D�:HE�6LWH
With QEF support and assistance from students and colleagues, I was able to create an 
expandable, flexible web programme that is designed to teach law students how to 
conduct an initial client-centred interview.  



)LJXUH����7KH�$UW�RI�,QWHUYLHZLQJ�+RPH�3DJH

����7KH�3URMHFW�7HDP�
A number of colleagues and students in Hong Kong and in Australia contributed to the 
development of the web site. All three staff members who coached the City University 
law students in preparation for the international competitions appear as feedback givers 
on the web site. In addition two staff members from City University Centre for the 
Enhancement of Learning and Teaching provided pedagogical advice and assumed 
responsibility for the formative and summative aspects of the project. First, second, and 
third-year City University law students played prominent roles as ‘lawyers’, ‘clients’, 
‘talking heads’, ‘research assistants’, ‘evaluators’, ‘assistant scenario writers’, 
‘administrators’, and general helpers. Web technical advice and assistance was provided 
by Crusher Wong and his colleagues in the Enterprise Solutions Unit at City University.
Filming, editing and web creation and production were provided in-house by staff and 
students under Wong’s direction. Launchpad Multimedia in Brisbane, Queensland, 
Australia was commissioned to provide graphics and additional technical advice on the 
project as it developed. 

����/HDUQLQJ�IURP�3DVW�3URMHFWV
In producing the web site, I built upon what I had learned from earlier IT initiatives. From 
previous experience, I had learned that I needed to address the concerns outlined by 
McConnell in his discussion about the use of the internet for distance learning. I needed 
to think about the kinds of knowledge that I wanted to introduce as well their method of 
introduction. In particular, I needed to identify specific learning outcomes. 

Once the scope of the undertaking was reasonably clear in my mind, I had to select an 
appropriate medium. Since the web site was to be used by law students working alone 



and in groups, since the site was designed to expand as a learning site as knowledge of 
effective client interviewing practices grows, and since the site needed to provide enough 
information to enable students to compete in local and international competitions, I 
needed a format and structure that would achieve these goals effectively and cost-
efficiently. I decided to develop a web site rather than produce a CD-ROM because I had 
been told that the web would give me greater flexibility at lower cost.

Originally I considered using the standard WebCT platform; however, it soon became 
clear that the platform needed to be modified. As Crusher Wong, the technical expert on 
the project team, explained to me, WebCT provides a standard interface of authentication 
that saves resources in user account management. In short, without WebCT, we would 
have had to start programme design from scratch.  In addition, if we wanted to limit 
access to a certain cohort of students, as I did, we would have had to create an 
authentication system that allowed students to log into the site.

My desire to use graphics to produce an attractive and user-friendly site involved 
additional planning for the site. To meet this challenge, Wong and his team at Enterprise 
Solutions created a consistent, self-contained template ZLWKLQ�a WebCT course account. 
Computer programming scripts were written by Wong’ s team so that students could 
access the bulletin board and chat room features offered by WebCT ZLWKLQ the template 
that was created, as opposed to elsewhere on the screen. The result is the production of a 
website that integrates WebCT tools with a specifically designed site.

Since students were expected to work through the site before face-to-face coaching was to 
occur with staff, I had to anticipate the sorts of problems that the students might 
encounter and minimise or eliminate them. I also had to respond to students’  needs and 
interests and their attitudes towards learning with IT. Fortunately, the students who were 
employed on the project provided the needed advice. They were happy to talk about 
students’  tastes and preferences, were willing to identify and solve some of the navigation 
problems that were encountered, were eager to help create the main menu for the site, and 
were keen to share ideas about the ‘look and feel’  of the web site. This meant that the site 
needed to be attractive and user-friendly. Students needed to be able to navigate 
successfully through the site, comfortably at their own pace.

����:HE�6LWH�)HDWXUHV



)LJXUH����7KH�0DLQ�0HQX
The web site contains various features, which include:

information about the development and use of the web site;

background text that introduces students to the concept of client-centred 
interviewing practice;

a one-page checklist/series of prompts for use in an initial interview of a client.

FRUH�YLGHRV that demonstrate various interviewing skills;

VWXGHQW�YLGHRV that illustrate the students’  progress as they learn about 
interviewing; and

counselling while they conduct their interview of ‘clients’  (people acting in role).

additional client interview scenarios that students can use to practise their 
interviewing skills;

a template that students can use to write their own scenarios so that they can 
create opportunities for additional practice;

videos of students as they debrief their interviews and text that explains the role 
and importance of the debriefing process;
  
information about, and a model for, giving and receiving constructive feedback;



information about client interviewing competitions. This section includes: 

information about the Louis M Brown International Client Counselling 
Competition;

a sample judging sheet;

instructions that are to be given to actors who play clients;

a list of additional resources and references that students may wish to consult.

����7KH�&RUH�9LGHRV
Clips from four videos that I had produced earlier and clips from two student videos that 
were produced by the City University students provide the main materials for the 
modelling of client interviewing and counselling  skills. The first student video was made 
as the team prepared to compete in the international competition; the second was made of 
their first interview in the international competition. In addition to these videos, this 
section of the web site includes a question and sample answer section for students to 
work through as they navigate through the web site. 

These videos and the questions and answers will remain on the web site as core 
teaching/learning materials. They will be added to as the site expands to include clips 
from student videos that are made in the future.

����$GGLWLRQDO��1RQ�&RUH��6WXGHQW�9LGHRV
This section of the web site contain extracts from digitally recorded videos made of two 
teams of third-year law students as they learned how to interview in preparation for the 
2001 and the 2002 international competitions. Thus, a user of the site can witness the 
progress of these teams of students as their interviewing and skills improve over time. 
Two videos have been added in 2002 to the ones filmed in 2001. In future some of these 
videos will be deleted and additional videos uploaded to the site as the students’  
knowledge deepens and as their performance improves from year to year. 

The scenarios for most of the non-core videos were based on the notes that were 
distributed to competitors before the international competition; however, I adapted the 
‘client’ s story’  to suit a Hong Kong audience (eg tenancy problems centred around life in 
a high rise building rather than in a ranch-style house; amounts of money discussed in an 
investment case reflected Hong Kong earnings, not American or Australian). The 
scenarios were designed to motivate students to adopt a deep approach to learning. This 
was essential because the 2001 International Counselling Competition focused on elder 
law and the 2002 Competition focused on environmental law, areas of law unfamiliar to 
the teams of student competitors.  Thus, the students had to learn the area of substantive 
law at the same time as they learned how to interview and counsel clients.



����'HEULHI�DQG�)HHGEDFN�6HFWLRQV
Paliwala and other scholars emphasise the importance of reflection in teaching clinical 
legal studies. This element is no less important when teaching more discrete lawyering 
skills such as interviewing and counselling. Here the departure from traditional forms of 
teaching is evident. Rather than focus on ‘transmitting largely predefined forms of 
knowledge with little if any connection with personal experience and critical reflection’ , 
(the typical lecture scenario), the debrief and feedback sections of the web site are 
designed to help students learn how to reflect on their work and that of their peers, and to 
teach students how to give and receive constructive feedback. 

The debrief section of the web section includes edited video extracts of the student 
‘lawyers’  as they talk about and reflect on the conduct of their interviews. The site also 
discusses the role and the importance of the debriefing process. 

The feedback section of the web site draws on the use of sound, visual image, and text. It 
has been designed to teach students about the value of feedback and the process of giving 
and receiving constructive feedback. This section of the site also includes an example of 
how to commence a constructive feedback conversation (voiceover and text) and a 
feedback quiz complete with sample answers.

In the debrief and feedback sections of the web the advantages of teaching with modern 
technology become apparent.  Student users of the site have immediate access to what the 
student lawyer team members thought about their interviews and what their peers and 
teachers considered were effective interviewing techniques. Moreover, the ready 
availability of feedback from more than one person enriches the learning experience 
overall. It provides fodder for general discussion about the nature and evaluation of 
professional practice, particularly if the feedback givers do not agree about what effective 
practice entails. Thus, it gives students insight into the construction of legal knowledge 
and expertise and the role of the professional community in that construction. Finally, the 
immediacy of the debrief and feedback as well as the opportunities that students have to 
revisit the videos and text at their convenience have been designed to enhance student 
learning.

The skills of self and peer assessment are developed in additional ways in the web site. In 
order to encourage students to learn from one another as well as from their teachers, the 
web designers adopted the bulletin board and chat room functions of WebCT, as noted 
above. Students, therefore, can comment in real-time or asynchronously on the interviews 
that they watch while they enhance their learning of interviewing and their learning of the 
language of constructive feedback.

The benefits of using chat rooms and bulletin boards in flexible learning initiatives are 
many. As Chickering and Ehrmann emphasise, these tools give students the chance to 
exchange ideas 

more speedily than before, and more thoughtfully and ‘safely’  than when 
confronting each other in a classroom or faculty office. Total communication 



increases and for many students the results seem more intimate, protected, and 
convenient than the more intimidating demands of face-to-face communication 
with faculty.

These advantages complement the team-based approach adopted in the local and 
international competitions since

‘(g)ood learning, like good work, is collaborative and social, not competitive and 
isolated’ .

����2SSRUWXQLWLHV�IRU�)XUWKHU�3UDFWLVH��8VLQJ�DQG�:ULWLQJ�,QWHUYLHZ�
6FHQDULRV�DQG�1RWHV�WR�)LOH
Since interviewing is a skill that needs regular practise, the web site offers students 
additional opportunities to enhance what they have learned. Additional interview 
scenarios have been written and a template for writing interview scenarios has been 
developed so that students can write their own scenarios and organise additional 
interviewing opportunities.

This section of the web site includes: a note to file that is made by a fictitious 
administrative assistant (the note provides some information about the interview for the 
lawyers (eg ‘Mr/Ms Wing telephoned. She was very agitated and wants to see you as soon 
as possible because her mother has been taken into hospital’ )); and instructions that are to 
be given to the actor who plays the client.

��,QWHJUDWLQJ�WKH�:HE�6LWH��&RPSOHPHQWDU\�5HVRXUFHV���7H[W�DQG�
7HDFKLQJ
Although the web site provides a basic stand-alone teaching tool, its use as a learning 
medium is easily enhanced through the use of text and face-to-face teaching. The web site 
is based, in part, on the text /HJDO�,QWHUYLHZLQJ��7KHRU\��7DFWLFV��DQG�7HFKQLTXHV��which I 
co-authored with Kay Lauchland. The video data bank supplements learning from this 
text by complementing and going beyond the text. The site demonstrates aspects of 
effective and less effective practice. Students, therefore, are encouraged to supplement 
their web learning by consulting the book. 

Had the web site been produced as an integral part a subject offering in the law 
curriculum at City University, I would have designed the site differently.  As the main use 
of the web site is to teach law students in Hong Kong interviewing to prepare them to 
enter the international competition (and to save me face-to-face teaching time), I had to 
adjust my goals. Rather than offer a site that would be accompanied by regular face-to-
face coaching, I needed to develop a site that would prepare the students to, as it were, 
‘hit the ground running’ . I did not have the time or resources to coach novice team 
members, hold an internal competition as well as continue with coaching the winning 
team in preparation for the international competition.



It is clear that this approach has proved most successful.  Several teams of students used 
the web site in 2002 to prepare for the internal competition. The students demonstrated
that they had learned the basic stages of the interview and counselling process because 
they were able to conduct an interview with some confidence, ease, and understanding. 
Their abilities showed me how effective, and efficient, on-line teaching of legal skills can 
be.  

The web site has saved considerable face-to-face contact time. The students had learned 
many of the basic skills involved in interviewing directly from the web, thus saving me 
considerable hours of (in some instances, very routine) coaching. Once my colleague and 
I selected the winning City University team, we offered less than 12 hours of 
individualised coaching to help the team prepare for the Louis M Brown International 
Client Counselling Competition that was held in Florida in April 2002. 

The burden of organising and holding the internal knock-out competition was lightened in 
another way. The law student who won the ‘Lucky Draw’  and participated as an observer 
in the 2001 international competition was in charge of the administration and organisation 
of the internal knock-out competition in 2002. As a condition of his participation, the 
student who won the draw in 2002 and joined us as an observer in the international 
competition in 2002 will organise the internal competition in 2003.

���([SDQGLQJ�WKH�:HE�6LWH
As noted above, the client interviewing and  web site was designed to grow as the skills 
of student interviewers at City University develop. For example, videos of interviews, and 
debrief and feedback sessions made in 2002 have been edited and uploaded to the web. 
The resource and reference list developed in 2001 was updated in 2002 and a virtual 
library is currently under construction for use by City University students. Once it is 
finished, the virtual library will be uploaded to the site as well. Other sections of the 
remainder of the site have been updated so that only what is most educationally useful 
and current is retained. Thus, the entire package will develop at the same time as the 
students' knowledge of interviewing and counselling increases. 

����&KDOOHQJHV�DQG�2EVWDFOHV
As this was the first web site that I have produced for the teaching of legal skills, I needed 
to learn about web capacities and capabilities as the project progressed. I faced a number 
of challenges and had to learn about the process as the project took shape.

����&XVWRPLVDWLRQ�DQG�8VHUV
I convened a number of meetings with the project team before the main menu was created 
because it took me some time to visualize how the students would navigate the site in a 
systematic fashion.  Once the design of menu was clear, I needed to customise the site to 
accommodate the topics that needed to be included in the site. 



The web site also needed to be designed to accommodate the needs and interests of first 
time users and repeat users.  The project team needed to solve a number of problems at 
the onset. The main hurdle was deciding on layout and display. For example, we tried to 
squeeze too many items on to the navigation bar, and the frame went out of space (and 
sight). Deciding which items were to be placed on various levels of access proved time 
consuming. The project team operated on the assumption that student users were 
generally impatient and unforgiving when they used educational sites. In order to attract 
the students’  interest and maintain their attention by ensuring the site operated at a pace 
suitable to them, we placed the most interesting features such as the online videos on the 
first level of navigation. We hoped that this would entice students into the other levels of 
the site where they could begin reading text and completing the exercises. 

����µ/RRN�DQG�)HHO�¶�7H[W�DQG�*UDSKLFV
One of the biggest problems that I faced initially was in the management of the amount of 
text that wanted included in the site. I was used to writing books and text for CD-ROMs, 
not for web sites. Here the advice of the project team proved invaluable. To be effective, I 
realised that I needed to minimise the amount of text per ‘web page’  and find a way to 
make the text interesting. I did a considerable amount of writing and rewriting text and 
thinking about and experimenting with layout (eg the use of font, boxes, shadow, image).

On top of these needs, I wanted to develop a Chinese look to the site to remind students 
of the culturally-specific nature of client interviewing. I also wanted to site to be visually 
appealing and demonstrate the artistry in interviewing and counselling (hence the title, 
‘You and Your Client: The Art of Legal Interviewing’ ).  I believed that good graphics 
were essential to provide illustration as well as nuance and appeal.

To give student users the sensation that they were watching an (artful) interview as it 
progressed, the graphics on the menu page include a Chinese screen that appears on the 
left had side and top of the computer screen. Chinese motifs, images, and characters were 
developed by Launchpad Multimedia. They were designed to convey both feeling and 
meaning as well as beauty (eg the use of the crane to symbolise longevity and the lotus to 
symbolise purity and perfection; the inclusion of Chinese characters that depict various 
terms in law and in interviewing (eg communication); the use of bamboo for colour and 
visual balance; the depiction of a SDLU�of hands presenting a business card to a client’ s 
two hands as is customary in introductions in Hong Kong). The inclusion of these images 
were designed to evoke the style reminiscent of paintings on traditional Chinese screens.

Launchpad also created the other graphics that are depicted in the web site. The use of 
graphics had to be limited, however, so that students could download files with ease. As a 
result both PDF and HTML formats were used. The PDF format was employed, for 
example, for the interview checklist and the sample judging sheet to provide for ease in 
printing. 

Launchpad faced the challenge of meeting specific graphic design needs while working 
from a distance both geographically and culturally. Although Launchpad has extensive 
experience with culturally-sensitive projects within Australia, they had not developed a 



product for a predominantly Chinese audience before. Considerable discussion took place 
about appropriate designs and styles to use. Launchpad created a number of prototype 
designs that were commented upon by the project team before the final design was 
chosen. This back-and-forth process was conducted by e-mail, ensuring that the work 
progressed smoothly and quickly.

On a more technological note, the main issue that Launchpad and Crusher Wong and his 
team had to address was format: should the site be created in Flash or HTML? Flash 
websites are popular because they generally contain more animations and tend to appear 
smoother to the eye of the viewer. However, they cannot be searched by web search 
engines, and they require plug-ins to the user’ s Internet browser. Ultimately, the decision 
was made to use HTML because it also offered the benefit of easier insertion of graphics 
into the final site. Thus the graphics were developed as HTML documents by Launchpad 
and then sent to Hong Kong for insertion into the web site by Wong and his team.

An additional consideration was that some of the downloadable documents also needed 
graphics to make the site more appealing. Due to the educational nature of the website, a 
number of documents had to be created in a way so that they could be downloaded by 
students. Launchpad created complementary background graphics for these as JPEG files. 
These graphics were incorporated into the documents, then the documents were saved as 
PDF (Adobe Acrobat) files. The saving of the files as PDF files was necessary to reduce 
the size of the files (leading to quicker downloads); it also made the files more difficult to 
edit, thus preserving their original formatting.  

����7LPHOLQH�DQG�6WXGHQW�$VVLVWDQFH
The entire project was due for completion in approximately nine months.  This timeline 
proved unrealistic. Since the project unexpectedly ran over the summer months, I had 
difficulty securing student support throughout the life of the project. As a result, time was 
lost because I had to replace some key team members. This delay, in turn, affected the 
final stage of the project - the evaluation.

���(YDOXDWLRQ
Originally the Project Evaluator Joe Hong had hoped to draw on the work of the 
Flashlight Project to help evaluate the site. In short, the Flashlight Project has developed 
tools to evaluate the impact of technology on learning outcomes. This approach proved 
impossible to adopt because Flashlight is designed for use by a large number of students, 
and the number of students who were interested in participating in the 2002 competition 
was small.

As a result, face-to-face unstructured interviews were conducted by W S (Grace) Lo at the 
end of 2001. The student teams who registered to compete in the internal competition in 
2002 were invited to attend the interviews. At the interview, the students were asked to 
express their opinions on the usability of the site and to discuss the impact of the use 
technology on their learning of interviewing and counselling.



The students reported that the site gave them an exposure to client-centred interview and 
counselling techniques. They said that they found the videos helpful and more effective 
than reading books about interviewing. The use of the multimedia tool helped gave them 
general idea of the topic, and they stated that they believed that they could learn faster in 
the coming training sessions as a result. The video component of the site also enhanced 
the students’  abilities to reflect on the client-centred interview and counselling process. 
Interestingly, the students reported that from using the web site they realized that they 
should evaluate their own performance after an interview - thereby learning about the 
importance of the role of reflection in professional practice.

����/HVVRQV�/HDUQHG
As with the other IT materials that I have developed, I learned a number of lessons from 
this project.

The first reinforces lessons that I have already learned.  It concerns the central role that 
students (and colleagues) play in developing computer-assisted learning materials. This 
web site could not have been developed as easily or as successfully without the active and 
enthusiastic cooperation of the law students and the media students. Despite their initial 
reticence and lack of confidence, particularly when facing the cameras, almost all 
students (and staff) who participated in the project threw themselves into the project with 
gusto. Even the team who was unsuccessful in the internal knock-out competition helped 
coach the winning team in preparation for the international competition by providing 
constructive feedback and support. This team (and a member of the 2001 City University 
team) also generously coached the team that represented City University in the 
international competition in 2002.

�����,I�,�:HUH�WR�8QGHUWDNH�D�3URMHFW�RI�7KLV�1DWXUH�$JDLQ�«
Were I were to undertake a project of this nature again (and happily I would), I would 
devote more time to teaching students (and colleagues) how to give constructive 
feedback. I would introduce them to various models of feedback and explain why the 
coaching model that I prefer to use is effective. I would also give the students ample 
opportunity to give feedback to their peers and to debrief their feedback. I would then 
give them feedback on their feedback and on their feedback debrief. I would film some of 
the sessions and upload the more appropriate extracts. The current feedback video 
extracts do not adequately demonstrate the coaching aspect that I believe is central to 
giving feedback that is constructive. This limitation may be rectified in future versions of 
the site.

I would keep a closer watch on the filming of the videos to ensure that the images that I 
wanted were actually captured on film (eg by way of close up).  In order to save costs and 
provide learning opportunities for university students generally, media students were 
employed who did not have sufficient understanding of the process of legal interviewing 
and counselling to be able to capture on film what was significant in the interview 



process.  A considerable amount of, what could have been usable, footage was lost as a 
result.

If budget would permit, I would hire experienced actors to do the voiceovers and assume 
the role of ‘talking head’  to save time and enhance quality.

I would also keep closer check on the creation of some of the text-based resources to 
ensure that the students who assumed responsibility for developing these materials 
understood exactly what was involved and when the material list was due. 

I would work to ensure that all members of the project were able to cooperate as members 
of a team. There was less HVSLULW�GH�FRUSV in this project than in the ones I have managed 
in the past.  Some students were less willing than others to pitch in to do what needed to 
be done; one regularly tried to ‘pull rank’  on the others.  

I would highlight the importance of working to a deadline and enforce deadlines strictly. 
Getting students (and some staff) to meet deadlines proved problematic throughout the 
life of the project. As a result, I would be more realistic about the time within which the 
project could be finished.  For example, if I were to experience delays in future projects, I 
would liaise more closely with other project members to ensure that they could continue 
to participate actively in the project at the time their input was needed.  

I would have learned more about the ‘static’  features of the web site itself before we 
commenced the project in earnest. For example, it was only as we neared completion that 
I realised that certain features of the site could not be changed (eg the colour of the video 
bar). Had I known about these features, I would have opted for a more complementary 
colour scheme for some of the sections of the web site.

���0DLQWHQDQFH�RI�WKH�:HE�6LWH�DQG�)XWXUH�'HYHORSPHQW
[T]here is a serendipity of education, legal education, and information technology 
in education theories in emphasising student centred, independent, situated, 
contextual, active and reflective learning .… [I]t would be foolish to ignore C&IT 
in legal education … C&IT can, through new modes of illumination and careful 
exploration, transcend the limitations of the linear text form and promote slow 
digestion of issues over time. It can provide conversational space beyond the 
classroom.

In the evaluation of the site conducted by Lo, the students suggested: that options should 
be offered to students for viewing the videos either in ‘Windows Media Player’  or ‘Real 
Player; that links to download the ‘Windows Media Player’  and ‘Real Player should be 
provided; that additional navigation buttons, such as ‘Page Back,’  should be included; 
and that new pop-up windows should be minimized.

The students also suggested that the site should include a chat room to allow them to 
interact with their classmates on scheduled time. Instead of providing all the information 
to students, the chat room could stimulate their critical thinking and also the interest in 



the topic through discussion with others. Although bulletin board and chat rooms feature 
are available, no schedule had been created. Were I to offer interviewing and counselling 
as a formal subject of study, I would made sure that the chat room and bulletin board 
provided key teaching/learning opportunities (see below).

In addition, the students reported that they had difficulty identifying the skills involved in 
interviewing and counselling when viewing the videos because there was no guidance 
provided. Were more time and additional funding available, I would respond directly to 
this excellent suggestion. I would provide additional opportunities for students to interact 
with the medium (for example by asking students to identify the exact skill that is 
demonstrated and discuss the effectiveness of the performance).  In addition, I would 
improve the section on assessment, I would add a pre-test and a post-test, and I would 
further develop the self and peer assessment sections of the site.

����8VLQJ�WKH�:HE�6LWH�LQ�D�&RXUVH�RQ�&OLHQW�,QWHUYLHZLQJ�DQG�
&RXQVHOOLQJ
If I were to offer a course on client interviewing and some time in the future, the web site 
would be central to the teaching/learning approach adopted in the course. It would not be 
the only approach that I would use, however. Although bulletin boards and chat rooms 
provide opportunities for students and academic staff to interact, particularly if the 
‘discussions’  are threaded, and although these tools may encourage less confident 
students to engage more in ‘discussions,’  my impression, at least to date, is that web 
delivery by itself cannot replace the benefits of face-to-face contact. I would supplement 
web teaching with individualised and group coaching so that my students - and I - remain 
motivated and interested. I believe that the adoption of such an approach, one which 
integrates on-line teaching with face-to-face teaching, will help teachers understand and 
address any misconceptions that their students have and help their students learn in 
greater depth about the artistry involved in interviewing and counselling clients.

����8VLQJ�WKH�6LWH�2XWVLGH�/DZ�DQG�2XWVLGH�+RQJ�.RQJ
The success of IT-based teaching/learning approaches depends, in part, on how an 
institution and the culture of an institution think about education and educational change. 
The client interviewing and counselling web site that I have developed with my students 
and colleagues is currently restricted for use by City University law students who wish to 
compete in the local and international competitions. In future, access may be granted for 
City University students enrolled in other disciplines who wish to learn about some of the 
transferable skills involved in legal interviewing and counselling.

In April 2002 I demonstrated sections of the web site to members of academic staff who 
attended the Louis M Brown International Client Counselling Competition held in 
Florida. Several participants were very interested in the power that technology has to 
teach interviewing and counselling skills; some asked if they could purchase copies of the 
site on CD-ROM. Since the site was developed specifically for students in Hong Kong for 
in-house educational purposes, rather than sell or otherwise distribute the entire site, at 



present I am investigating how Crusher Wong and I can develop a template so that others 
can use the template to create their own culturally and contextually-specific flexible 
learning materials. Given the availability of digital and video cameras and the relative 
ease with which video can be made, edited, and uploaded, these local sites that have been 
built on the template with locally produced videos could then be used to teach client 
interviewing and counselling to students anywhere in the world.

���0DQ\�5RDGV�/HDG�WR�/HDUQLQJ
Many roads lead to learning.  Different students bring different talents and styles to 
(university).  Brilliant students in a seminar might be all thumbs in a lab or studio; 
students rich in hands-on experience may not do so well with theory. Students need 
opportunities to show off their talents and learn in ways that work for them. Then they 
can be pushed in new ways that do not come so easily.

In ‘Implementing the Seven Principles: Technology as Lever,’  Chickering and Ehrmann 
relate (DOEHLW� in relation to the World Wide Web) how many faculty report that students 
feel stimulated by knowing their finished work will be ‘published.’  This was clearly the 
case with student involvement in developing the web site for teaching students to 
interview and counsel clients. Upon viewing her performance for the first time on the 
web, one young law student competitor exclaimed with glee (and with a beaming smile), 
‘I’ m a star!’  When the other students whose performances were captured on video 
watched their performances at the launch of the web site in 2001, there was a marvelous 
feeling of accomplishment, of delight, and of magic.


